TRANSBAY JOINT POWERS AUTHORITY

TABULATION OF BIDS

Contract No.:
Trade Package:
Bids Received:

Bidders:

08-04-CMGC-000

TGO7.1R - Structural Steel Superstructure (TG07.1E, TG07.1C & TG07.1W)

20-Jun-13
Tutor-Saliba/SME  |Southland Contracting | Shimmick/Danny's JV Skanska Average Bid Engineer's Estimate % of Engineer's
Steel/W&W JV 9 9 Estimate
Total Bid $ 219,777,000.00 | $ 209,127,000.00 | $ 193,990,000.00 | $ 189,107,936.00 | $ 203,000,484.00 | $ 180,000,000.00 113%




TRANSBAY JOINT POWERS AUTHORITY
BID FORM COMPARISON SHEET

Contract No.:

08-04-CMGC-000

Trade Package: TGO7.1R - Structural Steel Superstructure (TG07.1E, TG07.1C & TG07.1W)
Bids Received: 06-20-2013

Tutor-Saliba/SME Steel/W&W Joint Venture Southland Contracting Shimmick/Danny's Joint Venture Skanska
No. |ltem Description lear;;Srfe TGO07.1E TGO07.1C TGO07.1W TGO07.1E TGO07.1C TGO07.1W TGO07.1E TGO07.1C TGO07.1W TGO07.1E TGO07.1C TGO07.1W
Ground Level Steel Elements and Below
1 [TRAIN BOX COLUMNS LS $ 5,792,000.00 [ $ 5,685,000.00 [ $ 6,694,000.00 | $ 3,710,000.00 | $ 3,970,000.00 | $ 5,120,000.00 | $ 2,800,000.00 [ $ 2,800,000.00 | $ 3,200,000.00 | $ 4,377,083.00 | $ 4,865,626.00 | $ 6,135,817.00
2 |BEAMS & GIRDERS LS $18,489,000.00 | $ 15,822,000.00 | $ 23,615,000.00 | $ 14,000,000.00 | $ 15,000,000.00 | $ 19,200,000.00 | $ 12,000,000.00 | $ 12,000,000.00 | $ 13,200,000.00 | $13,131,250.00 | $ 12,475,964.00 | $ 18,407,452.00
3 |METAL DECKING & STUDS LS $ 398,000.00 | $ 457,000.00 | $ 556,000.00 | $ 175,000.00 | $ 186,000.00 | $ 240,000.00 | $ 300,000.00 | $ 300,000.00 | $ 400,000.00 | $ 306,396.00 | $ 289,074.00 | $ 441,779.00
4 |HGHT COLUMN &RINGS (up to & including ring at LS $  3,184,000.00 $  5400,000.00 $  1,500,000.00 $  3,926,923.00
elevation +12’-0")
Above Grade Steel Elements
5 |BASKET COLUMNS LS $19,772,000.00 | $ 19,400,000.00 | $ 26,372,000.00 | $10,360,000.00 | $ 11,070,000.00 | $ 14,300,000.00 | $ 11,000,000.00 | $ 11,000,000.00 | $ 12,200,000.00 | $15,335,827.00 | $ 12,475,964.00 | $ 20,248,197.00
6 [COLUMNS, BEAMS & GIRDERS LS $31,547,000.00 | $ 37,657,000.00 | $ 47,586,000.00 | $29,000,000.00 | $ 31,000,000.00 | $ 40,000,000.00 | $ 28,500,000.00 | $ 28,500,000.00 | $ 35,000,000.00 | $27,513,095.00 | $ 27,447,120.00 | $ 38,042,068.00
7 |METAL DECKING & STUDS LS $ 1,080,000.00 [ $ 1,233,000.00 [ $ 1,448,000.00|$ 776,000.00 | $ 830,000.00 [ $ 1,070,000.00 | $ 700,000.00 | $ 700,000.00 | $ 800,000.00 | $ 1,375,655.00 [ $ 1,372,356.00 | $ 1,272,791.00
8 |LIGHT COLUMNS & RINGS (above elevation +12-07) LS $ 7,953,000.00 $ 9,500,000.00 $ 4,000,000.00 $ 6,381,250.00
Project Administration
9 |MOBILIZATION LS $ 3,915,000.00 [ $ 4,086,000.00 [ $ 6,354,000.00 | $ 3,000,000.00 | $ 3,100,000.00 | $ 4,500,000.00 | $ 3,000,000.00 [ $ 3,000,000.00 | $ 3,000,000.00 | $ 2,527,684.00 | $ 2,465,000.00 | $ 3,945,000.00
10 |[INSURANCE LS $  940,000.00 | $ 981,000.00 [ $ 1,525,000.00 | $ 101,500.00 | $ 108,500.00 | $ 140,000.00 | $ 460,000.00 | $ 460,000.00 | $ 500,000.00 | $ 1,398,165.00 | $ 1,555,753.00 | $ 2,374,561.00
11 |BOND LS $  749,000.00 | $ 780,000.00 [ $ 1,143,000.00 | $ 580,000.00 | $ 620,000.00 | $ 800,000.00 | $ 370,000.00 | $ 370,000.00 | $ 430,000.00 | $ 663,316.00 | $ 738,078.00 [ $ 1,126,536.00
12 |Allowance 10B Traffic Officers Allowance| $  500,000.00 | $ 500,000.00 | $ 500,000.00 | $ 500,000.00 | $ 500,000.00 | $ 500,000.00 | $ 500,000.00 | $ 500,000.00 | $ 500,000.00 | $ 500,000.00 | $ 500,000.00 | $ 500,000.00
TOTAL BASE BID PRICE $83,182,000.00 | $ 86,601,000.00 | $126,930,000.00 | $62,202,500.00 | $ 66,384,500.00 [ $100,770,000.00 | $ 59,630,000.00 | $ 59,630,000.00 | $ 74,730,000.00 | $67,128,471.00 | $ 64,184,935.00 | $ 102,802,374.00
BOND RATE 0.90% 0.87% 0.60% 1.08%
Total Bid Price in $'s (Including all discounts for any multi- | Total Bid Price in $'s (Including all discounts for any multi- | Total Bid Price in $'s (Including all discounts for any multi- |Total Bid Price in $'s (Including all discounts for any multi-
Work Part ) ; . :
part Bid) part Bid) part Bid) part Bid)
| |TGO7.1W $ 83,182,000.00 $ 62,202,500.00 No Bid $ 67,128,471.00
Il |TG07.1C $ 86,601,000.00 $ 66,384,500.00 No Bid $ 64,184,935.00
Il |TGO7.1E $126,930,000.00 $100,770,000.00 No Bid $102,802,374.00
IV |TG07.1W and TG07.1C (including all discounts) No Bid $ 128,587,000.00 No Bid No Bid
V. |[TG07.1W and TGO07.1E (including all discounts) No Bid $162,972,500.00 No Bid No Bid
VI |TG07.1C and TGO7.1E (including all discounts) No Bid $167,154,500.00 No Bid No Bid
VIl |TG07.1W, TG07.1C and TGO7.1E (including all discounts) $219,777,000.00 $ 209,127,000.00 $ 193,990,000.00 $189,107,936.00




Contract No.:

Title:

BIDDER 1

BIDDER 2

08-04-CMGC-000

TGO07.1R - Structural Steel Superstructure (TG07.1E, TG07.1C & TG07.1W)

Tutor-Saliba/SME Steel/W&W Joint Venture SBE/DBE| S/DBE
15901 Olden Street ? Type
Sylmar, CA 91342 No -

Subcontractors Location Listed Portion Amount SBE SBE

of Work Type
Analysis and Solution Consultants San Francisco, CA  |Vibration Noise Monitoring $ 77,550.00 Yes Cucp
Apex Testing Laboratories, Inc. San Francisco, CA |On-site Inspection $ 1,893,200.00 Yes HRC, DGS
Black Bear Security Services, Inc. San Francisco, CA  [Security Guard Service $ 236,223.00 Yes HRC, DGS
CMC Traffic Control Specialists San Francisco, CA  [Flagging/Traffic Control $ 646,800.00 Yes CUCP, DGS
G&C Equipment Corporation Gardena, CA Furnish Raw and Misc Steel $  22,440,000.00 Yes CUCP, DGS
Karla's Maid San Francisco, CA  |Janitorial Services $ 56,000.00 Yes HRC
Mike O'Brien Specialized Hauling San Francisco, CA  |Trucking $ 600,000.00 Yes CUCP, HRC
Municon Consultants San Francisco, CA  [Photo Survey $ 39,500.00 Yes HRC, DGS
First Fuel, Inc. Newport Beach, CA [Provide Fuel $ 500,000.00 Yes DGS
Sandis Civil Engineering Sunnyvale, CA Survey $ 600,000.00 Yes DGS
B.T. Mancini Milpitas, CA Furnish/install Metal Decking $ 2,826,000.00 No
SBE Total| $ 27,089,273 | 12.33%

Southland Contracting SBE/DBE| S/DBE
6635 Sandshell Blvd. ? Type
Ft. Worth, TX 76137 No -

Subcontractors Location Listed Portion Amount SBE SBE

of Work Type
Pro Steel Erectors, Inc. Kingsbury, TX Steel Erection $ 8,000,000.00 No
Thomas Decoste DBA / Thomas J's Welding Arnold, CA Welding $ 3,600,000.00 Yes DGS
Apex Testing Laboratories, Inc. San Francisco, CA  [Quality Control $ 1,400,000.00 Yes DGS
Accurate Land Solutions San Leandro, CA Land Surveying $ 350,000.00 Yes DGS
Hernandez Engineering San Francisco, CA  [Traffic Control $ 1,500,000.00 Yes HRC
Western Erectors, Inc. Escalon, CA _IE_:ng.oggzisri]sgtancell:abrication/ $ 4,000,000.00 Yes HRC
Earthquake and Structures, Inc. Oakland, CA Professional Services $ 300,000.00 Yes DGS
Al Protective Services, Inc. San Francisco, CA  [Security $ 300,000.00 Yes HRC
Analysis and Solution Consultants San Francisco, CA  [Noise Monitoring $ 70,000.00 Yes DGS
First Fuel, Inc. Newport Beach, CA  [Petroleum Products $ 500,000.00 Yes CucpP
Beck Steel, Inc. Lubbock, TX Structural Steel $ 116,362,000.00 No
B.T. Mancini Milpitis, CA Metal Decks/Studs $ 2,826,000.00 No
Kwan Wo Ironworks, Inc. (2nd tier to Beck Steel) Hayward, CA Structural Steel $  13,638,000.00 Yes DGS
SBE Total| $ 25,658,000 | 12.27%




BIDDER 3

BIDDER 4

Shimmick/Danny's Joint Venture SBE/DBE| S/DBE
8201 Edgewater Drive, Suite 202 ? Type
Oakland, CA 94621 No -

Subcontractors Location Listed Portion Amount SBE SBE

of Work Type
Max Fusion San Ramon, CA BRB 66,310.00 Yes CUCP, DGS
Analysis and Solution Consultants Oakland, CA Noise and Vibration 60,800.00 Yes CUCP, DGS
Kwan Wo Ironworks, Inc. Hayward, CA Steel Erection/ Stairs (partial) 900,000.00 Yes CUCDP(';;'RC’
Martin Ron San Francisco, CA  [Survey 708,750.00 Yes HRC, DGS
B.C. Lawson Drayage, Inc. (2nd tier to Canam) Hayward, CA Trucking for Steel Supply 2,254,000.00 Yes DGS
Kwan Wo Ironworks, Inc. (2nd tier to Canam) Hayward, CA Fabricate Elevator/Stairs 4,783,296.00 Yes CUCDP(';;'RC’
Summit Steel Works Corporation (2nd tier to Canam) Mountain View, CA [Anchor Bolts/Rod Fab 291,016.00 Yes DGS
C&K Johnson, Inc. (2nd tier to Canam) Arcata, CA ;iz OCS Framing, Train Box Embeds, & Tie 7,419,800.00 Yes DGS
Foxcover Trucking (2nd Tier to B.T. Mancini) San Francisco, CA  |Trucking Material for B.T. Mancini 135,650.00 Yes DGS, HRC
Apex Testing Laboratories, Inc. San Francisco, CA  [QC (partial) 612,600.00 Yes HRC, DGS
CMC Traffic Control Specialists, Inc. San Francisco, CA  [Traffic Control (partial) 504,000.00 Yes CUCP, DGS
Faye Stewart Transportation (Lower tier to Canam) Phoenix, AZ Hauling for partial Steel Supply 1,100,000.00 Yes CucP
BEI Steel San Francisco, CA  [Metal Decking 900,000.00 Yes HRC, DGS
First Fuel, Inc. Newport Beach, CA |Fuel Supply 960,000.00 Yes CUCP, DGS
USA Trucking Fairfield, CA Marshalling Yard Trucking (partial) 1,160,000.00 Yes CucpP
Team North Construction Services San Francisco, CA  [Marshalling Yard Trucking (partial) 1,160,000.00 Yes HRC
Mike O'Brien Specialized Hauling San Francisco, CA  [Marshalling Yard Rent 275,000.00 Yes HRC
SBE Total 23,291,222.00 | 12.01%

Skanska USA Civil West California District, Inc. SBE/DBE| S/DBE
1995 Aqua Mansa Road ? Type
Riverside, CA 90509 No -

Subcontractors Location Listed Portion Amount SBE SBE

of Work Type
XKT Engineering Vallejo, CA Steel Fabrication 17,617,432.00 Yes DGS
B.C. Lawson Drayage, Inc. Hayward, CA Trucking 460,000.00 Yes DGS
Big Mouth Productions San Francisco, CA  |Photography 40,000.00 Yes DGS
Analysis and Solution Consultants Oakland, CA Noise Monitoring 207,000.00 Yes CucpP
Townsend Management San Francisco, CA |QA/QC 219,053.50 Yes DGS
Montez Group San Francisco, CA |QA/QC 219,053.50 Yes DGS
Harrison & Bonini San Francisco, CA  |Bolt Supplier 500,000.00 Yes HRC
Marina Securities Services San Francisco, CA  |Security 199,520.00 Yes CucpP
First Fuel, Inc. Newport Beach, CA |Fuel Supplier 955,000.00 Yes CucpP
Kwan Wo Ironworks, Inc. Hayward, CA Grinding/Misc Field Work 619,763.00 Yes DGS
Linden Steel & Construction Manteca, CA Steel Decking 3,219,000.00 Yes DGS
SBE Total 24,255,822 | 12.83%




